Subject:  Re: Payment Receipt
Date: 10/13/2020 2:34:16 PM Eastern Standard Time §
From: bellsigEin (@ gmail.com '

To: paultshane@aol.com

Thank you,couldn't done it without you. Will do

On Tue, Oct 13, 2020, 2:25 PM Paul T. Shane <paultshane@aol.com> wrote:
Dear ampsives--

- Attached is the payment receipt for $300.00. Thank you. Don't forget to scan me a copy of your Naturalization certificate.
~ Congrats again.

Regards,
Paul

Paul T. Shane
IMMIGRATION ATTORNEY
Independent Law Offices

- 300 Washington Street, Suite 350
Newton, MA 02458-2802 USA

TEL: 617 965 1553
FAX: 617 965 9697
EMAIL: PaulTShane@aol.com
- WEBSITE: WWW.PAULSHANE.COM

From: mykyoceracopierscanner@gmail.com
To: paultshane@aol.com
Sent: Tue, Oct 13, 2020 2:15 pm

paultshane's mailbox 17



